DUNBAR CREEK WWTP
HEADWORKS MODIFICATIONS
ST. SIMONS ISLAND, GEORGIA

JWSC PROJECT NO. 412

TABULATION OF BIDS

21-May-14

Legal and Character Qualifications

E-Verify Contractor Affidavit
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1. S. Haren Company | S 331,000.00 | 5 160,000.00 | § 491,000.00
Flow Control Gates
Golden Harvest $ 10,000.00
Rodney Hunt S 8,000.00
Northcoast Valve & Gate, Inc. No Bid
WACO Products, Inc. $ 12,000.00
Knife Gate Valves
Dezurik S 33,000.00
Red Valve No Bid
Mueller No Bid
ITT C67 Bi-Directional S 20,000.00
Mechanical Screen
Vulcan S 140,000.00
Wes-Tec S 165,000.00
Layne Heavy Civil, Inc. $ 332,468.00 | $ 233,862.00 | $ 566,330.00
Flow Control Gates
Golden Harvest S 14,183.00
Rodney Hunt S 8,480.00
Northcoast Valve & Gate, Inc. S 10,859.00
WACO Products, Inc. $ 13,395.00
Knife Gate Valves
Dezurik S 35,510.00
Red Valve No Bid
Mueller No Bid
ITT C67 Bi-Directional S 46,447.00
Mechanical Screen
Vulcan S 148,400.00
Wes-Tec S 174,900.00
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DUNBAR CREEK WWTP
HEADWORKS MODIFICATIONS
ST. SIMONS ISLAND, GEORGIA
JWSC PROJECT NO. 412

TABULATION OF BIDS

21-May-14
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Southern Champion Construction, Inc — $ 470,000.00 | $ 140,000.00 | $ 610,000.00
Flow Control Gates
Golden Harvest No Bid
Rodney Hunt No Bid
Northcoast Valve & Gate, Inc. No Bid
WACO Products, Inc. S  7,000.00
Knife Gate Valves
Dezurik S 30,000.00
Red Valve No Bid
Mueller No Bid
ITT C67 Bi-Directional S 45,000.00

Mechanical Screen

Vulcan

$ 125,000.00

Wes-Tec

Douglas Electrical & Plumbing Co., Inc.

$ 175,000.00

Flow Control Gates

S 432,346.00

$ 250,697.00

$ 683,043.00

Golden Harvest No Bid
Rodney Hunt S 12,204.00

Northcoast Valve & Gate, Inc. No Bid

WACO Products, Inc. No Bid

Knife Gate Valves

Dezurik S 47,323.00

Red Valve No Bid

Mueller No Bid

ITT C67 Bi-Directional No Bid

Mechanical Screen

Vulcan

$ 151,200.00

Wes-Tec

No Bid
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DUNBAR CREEK WWTP
HEADWORKS MODIFICATIONS
ST. SIMONS ISLAND, GEORGIA

JWSC PROJECT NO. 412

TABULATION OF BIDS

21-May-14
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5 |Allen & Graham, Inc. N | S 518,671.00 | $ 211,177.00 | $ 729,848.00
Flow Control Gates
Golden Harvest S 11,512.00
Rodney Hunt S 11,978.00
Northcoast Valve & Gate, inc. S 10,859.00
WACO Products, Inc. $ 13,396.00
Knife Gate Valves
Dezurik S 35,510.00
Red Valve No Bid
Mueller No Bid
ITT C67 Bi-Directional S 46,448.00
Mechanical Screen
Vulcan S 148,400.00
Wes-Tec S 174,900.00
| certify that this is a true and correct
copy of the bids received on May 21,
2014. No award has been made as of
this date.
Information highlighted in yellow indicates equipment used in Base Bid
Wﬁﬂw Date: L-77- i

N%mkeie, Ir., P.E. /
Stperintendent Planning & Construction Division

Brunswick-Glynn County Joint Water & Sewer Commission
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